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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Manhole Rings, Covers and Ring Risers

TIME & (October 1, 2015 through September 30, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 9, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

 450 ea.  

Hinged Type Design Manhole 24"; Rings and Covers w/locks Approved Manhole UNIT       

Rings and Covers PAMREX #ECDPA603A976LSAWS with locks, SAWS #31613 PRICE 301.00 NO BID 310.526 310.27 378.24 394.57

1. Brand Name Product TOTAL 135,450.00  139,736.70 139,621.50 170,208.00 177,556.50

50 ea.        

Hinged Type Design Watertight Manhole 30"; Rings and Covers; Approved        

Manhole Rings and Covers East Jordan Iron Works Watertite 41421075L01 UNIT

SAWS #34944 PRICE 828.50 NO BID 841.886 850.70 825.63 846.27

2. Brand Name Product TOTAL 41,425.00  42,094.30 42,535.00 41,281.50 42,313.50

50 ea.        

Hinged Type Designs 4 Bolt Manhole 24"; Rings and Covers; Approved Manhole UNIT       

Rings and Covers, East Jordan Iron Works 41418105L01, SAWS #45648 PRICE 379.50 NO BID 387.698 389.72 378.24 387.70

3. Brand Name Product TOTAL 18,975.00  19,384.90 19,486.00 18,912.00 19,385.00

 50 ea.        

Hinged Type Design 4 Bolt Manhole 30"; Rings and Covers; Approved Manholes UNIT       

Rings and Covers, East Jordan Iron Works 41421084L01, SAWS #45647 PRICE 828.50 NO BID 846.271 850.70 825.63 846.27

4. Brand Name Product TOTAL 41,425.00  42,313.55 42,535.00 41,281.50 42,313.50

125 ea.        

Key Wrench Manhole Lock for Pamrex Locking Lids; Approved Manhole Rings UNIT       

and Covers,  PAMREX #JC11, SAWS #33202 PRICE 23.50 NO BID 21.739 20.80 20.33 25.00

5. Brand Name Product TOTAL 2,937.50  2,717.38 2,600.00 2,541.25 3,125.00

125 ea.        

Key Wrench Manhole Lock for East Jordon Iron Locking Lids; Approved Manhole UNIT       

Rings and Covers, East Jordan ERGO 101324, SAWS #34890 PRICE 15.00 NO BID 14.652 14.11 13.71 14.78

6. Brand Name Product TOTAL 1,875.00  1,831.50 1,763.75 1,713.75 1,847.50

 50 ea.        

Lock Kit, 24 Inch for Pamrex Manhole Covers, Approved Manhole Rings and UNIT       

Covers, PAMREX #SP24PAMREXLCKK, SAWS #33203 PRICE 41.15 NO BID 38.043 36.59 35.57 41.85

7. Brand Name Product TOTAL 2,057.50  1,902.15 1,829.50 1,778.50 2,092.50

150 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Ring, Adjustable, Size 26-1/4 x 1-1/2 X 1-1/2, Approved Manhole UNIT       

Rings Riser, East Jordan Ironworks M5262515154A, SAWS  #15432 PRICE 179.65 141.43 180.158 179.21 173.93 178.28

8. Brand Name Product TOTAL 26,947.50 21,214.50 27,023.70 26,881.50 26,089.50 26,742.00

100 ea,        

Riser, Manhole Ring, Adjustable, Size 24 x 23-3/4 x 1-1/2 x 2, Approved Manhole UNIT       

Ring Risers, East Jordan Ironworks M2240015204A, SAWS #34284 PRICE 166.65 138.49 167.221 166.09 161.44 165.48

9. Brand Name Product TOTAL 16,665.00 13,849.00 16,722.10 16,609.00 16,144.00 16,548.00

175 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Ring, Adjustable, Size 25 x 24-3/4 x 1-1/2 x 1/2, Approved Manhole UNIT       

Rings Riser, East Jordan Ironworks M5250015154A, SAWS #34283 PRICE 166.65 135.43 165.116 166.09 161.44 165.48

10. Brand Name Product TOTAL 29,163.75 23,700.25 28,895.30 29,065.75 28,252.00 28,959.00

200 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Rings Riser, LADTECHC 33-1/2" x 23-3/4" x 5", x 23-1/4", UNIT       

SAWS #15427 PRICE 26.75 NO BID 25.421 25.55 26.25 25.42

11. Brand Name Product TOTAL 5,350.00  5,084.20 5,110.00 5,250.00 5,084.00

150 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Ring, HDPE, Size: 24" x 1-1/2", Approved Manhole Rings Riser, UNIT       

LADTECH 33-1/2" x 23-3/4" x 5" x 23-1/4", SAWS #15429 PRICE 26.75 NO BID 25.421 25.55 26.25 25.42

12. Brand Name Product TOTAL 4,012.50  3,813.15 3,832.50 3,937.50 3,813.00
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for

FOR: Manhole Rings, Covers and Ring Risers

TIME & (October 1, 2015 through September 30, 2016)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., September 9, 2015
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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200 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Ring, HDPE, Size 24" x 2", Approved Manhole Rings Riser UNIT       

LADTECH 33-1/2" x 23-3/4" x 5" x 23-1/4", SAWS #15430 PRICE 26.75 NO BID 25.421 25.55 26.25 25.42

13. Brand Name Product TOTAL 5,350.00  5,084.20 5,110.00 5,250.00 5,084.00

150 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Ring, HDPE, Size 24" x 4", Approved Manhole Rings Riser, UNIT       

LADTECH 33-1/2" x 23-3/4" x 5" x 23-1/4", SAWS #15428 PRICE 46.00 NO BID 43.663 43.89 45.09 45.48

14. Brand Name Product TOTAL 6,900.00  6,549.45 6,583.50 6,763.50 6,822.00

50 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Ring, HDPE, Size: 32" x 2", Approved Manhole Rings Riser, UNIT       

SAWS #34946 PRICE 46.00 NO BID 43.663 43.89 45.09 45.48

15. Brand Name Product TOTAL 2,300.00  2,183.15 2,194.50 2,254.50 2,274.00

50 ea.        

Riser, Manhole Ring, HDPE, Size 34" x 3", Approved Manhole Rings Riser, UNIT       

SAWS #34947 PRICE 46.00 NO BID 43.663 43.89 45.09 45.48

16. Brand Name Product TOTAL 2,300.00  2,183.15 2,194.50 2,254.50 2,274.00

TOTAL ITEMS AWARDED

EXTENSION 1

 

EXTENSION 2

EXTENSION 3

Net Net Net Net Net 2%

 Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery Days 10-15 days

*LOW BIDDER   

BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 
Act Pipe & Supply Demandstar

Corix SAWS Website

Ferguson Waterworks
Fortiline Waterworks

 Gajeske

HD Supply Waterworks

Hydropro Solutions

Morrison Supply
MS Techline Pipe

Port City Pipe Inc.
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